
Evaluation Matrix

Collection of Delinquent Accounts – RFP RMJ0307 (Secondary)

Evaluation

Category

Maximum

Points

Contract Caller 

Inc. 

Augusta, GA

Convergent 

Outsourcing Inc.

Houston, TX

Transworld 

Systems Inc.

Horsham, PA

SWC Corp

Carrolton, TX

I.C. System Inc.

St. Paul, MN

Phoenix Recovery 

Group

San Antonio, TX

Business 

Organization and 

Project 

Management 

Structure

15 13.00 14.00 no bid * * *

Solution and 

Program
15 13.50 13.00 no bid * * *

Recovery Rates 25 23.30 20.00 no bid * * *

Prior Experience 15 13.50 13.80 no bid * * *

Total Evaluated 

Price
20 20.00 19.20 no bid * * *

Local

Business

Presence

10 0.00 0.00 no bid * * *

Total 100 83.30 80.00 no bid * * *

* Deemed Non-Responsive - Did not meet the requirements of the solicitation related to the Minority Owned and Women Owned Business Enterprise Procurement Program.

NOTE:  As per Section 252.049 of the local government code, contents of a proposal shall remain confidential until a contract is awarded or as directed by the Texas Attorney General’s Office.

Therefore, the matrix will include points awards for price but exact pricing will not be disclosed.



Evaluation Matrix

Collection of Delinquent Accounts – RFP RMJ0307 (Tertiary)

Evaluation

Category

Maximum

Points

Contract Caller 

Inc. 

Augusta, GA

Convergent 

Outsourcing Inc.

Houston, TX

Transworld 

Systems Inc.

Horsham, PA

SWC Corp

Carrolton, TX

I.C. System Inc.

St. Paul, MN

Phoenix Recovery 

Group

San Antonio, TX

Business 

Organization and 

Project 

Management 

Structure

15 14.30 13.30 13.00 * * *

Solution and 

Program
15 14.50 12.80 10.50 * * *

Recovery Rates 25 23.50 20.50 14.00 * * *

Prior Experience 15 13.80 14.80 13.30 * * *

Total Evaluated 

Price
20 17.10 15.80 20.00 * * *

Local

Business

Presence

10 0.00 0.00 0.00 * * *

Total 100 83.20 77.20 70.80 * * *

* Deemed Non-Responsive - Did not meet the requirements of the solicitation related to the Minority Owned and Women Owned Business Enterprise Procurement Program.

NOTE:  As per Section 252.049 of the local government code, contents of a proposal shall remain confidential until a contract is awarded or as directed by the Texas Attorney General’s Office.

Therefore, the matrix will include points awarded for price but exact pricing will not be disclosed.


