OCO~NOUPA,WNE

ORDINANCE NO.

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING ARTICLE 8 OF CITY CODE CHAPTE R 25-
12 BY ADDING SECTIONS 25-12-181 INTERNATIONAL WILDL AND-
URBAN INTERFACE CODE, SECTION 25-12-182 CITATIONS TO THE
WILDLAND-URBAN INTERFACE CODE AND SECTION 25-12-183
LOCAL AMENDMENTS TO THE WILDLAN-URBAN INTERFACE COD E.

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF A USTIN:

PART 1. Article 8 (Reserved) of City Code Chapter 25-1Zd¢chnical Codes) is
amended to change the title to Wildland-Urban fatsg Code and add new secti
25-12-181, 25-12-182 and 25-12-183 to read asvisli

ARTICLE 8. WILDLAND-URBAN INTERFACE CODE  Reserved.
§ 25-12-181 — WILDLAND-URBAN INTERFACE CODE.

(A) The International Wildland-Urban Interface Code @mbendices A
through D, 2015 Edition, published by the Interoa#il Code Counc
(“2015 Wildland-Urban Interface Code”), are adopsed incorporate
by reference into this section with the changesmilesd in Subsectio
(B) and amendments in Section 25-12-1B8cal Amendments to the
2015 Wildland-Urban Interface Code).

(B)  The following sections are amended or deleted:

Pagel of 15

pns

oD L —




o Ol B~ WN -

[oo N

101.1 102.4 102.4.2 103.1 103.2

103.3 104.1 104.2 104.3 104.3.1
107.3 107.4 107.4.1 107.4.2 107.5
107.6 107.6.1 107.7 107.8 107.1
108.9 108.1 108.11 108.12 109.1
109.1.1 109.1.2 109.1.2.1 109.1.2.2 109.1.2.3
109.1.3 109.1.4 109..1.4.1 109.1.4.2 109.1.4.3
109.2 109.2.1 109.2.2 109.3 109.4
109.4.1 109.4.2 109.4.3 109.4.4 109.4.5
109.4.5.1 109.4.5.2 109.4.5.2.1 109.4.5.3 109.4.5.3.1
109.4.5.4 109.4.5.5 109.4.5.6 109.4.6 109.4.7
109.4.8 1101 110.2 110.3 1104
302.1 302.3 402.1.1 402.1.2 402.2.1
402.2.2 403.1 403.3.2 403.3 404.1
404.2 404.3 404.3.1 404.3.2 404.4
404.1 404.10.1 404.10.2 404.10.3 501.1
Table 502.1 503.1 Table 503.1 504.1 504.3
504.5 504.7 504.7.1 504.8 504.9
504.1 504.11 505 506 602
603.2.2 603.2.3 Appendix D

(C) _ The city clerk shall retain a copy of the 804/ildland-Urban Interfac
Code with the official ordinances of the City of gtin.

Source: Ord. 201XXXXX-XX.

§ 25-12-182 — CITATIONS TO THE WILDLAND-URBAN INTER FACE
CODE.

In_the City Code, "Wildland-Urban Interface Code'eans the 201
Wildland-Urban Interface Code as adopted by Sec#ibfl2-181 knternational

Page? of 15

D




w NP

Wildland-Urban Interface Code ) and as amended by Section 25-12-183dal
Amendments to the Wildland-Urban Interface Code).

Source: Ord. 201XXXXX-XX.

§ 25-12-183 - LOCAL AMENDMENTS TO THE WILDLAN-URBAN
INTERFACE CODE.

The following provisions are local amendments te #9015 Wildland-Urbapn
Interface Code. Each provision in this section isustitute for the identically
numbered provision deleted by Section 25-12-181#)dland-Urban Interface
Code) or is an addition to the 2015 Wildland-Urban hfaee Code:

101.1 Title.These regulations shall be known as the Wildlanbladrnterface Code

of the City of AustifNAME-OFJURISBICTION]-, hereinafter referred to as “this

code". All references to jurisdiction in this coslgall mean the City of Austin.

code-shall-be-those-that-are listed in Chapt&ele(enced Sandards) and Chapter
80 of the Fire Code, as amended, establishes ttes@nd standards referenced in

102.4 Referenced codes and standard$he-codesand standards referenced-r thj

Commented [BM1]: 102.4 and 102.4.2 were amended t
match the Fire Code. 102.4.1 was not changed as there|wet
no conflicts identified as in the Fire Code confligtin
mechanical and plumbing codes and standards.

the Wildland-Urban Interface Code—and—such—coded—standards—shall-he
i he rem jis-¢odk } exte each

102.4.2 Provisions in referenced codes and standatd Unless precedence |is
specified by another ordinance of the Cityy-wWhteeextent of the reference qo a

referenced code or standard includes subject niagéis within the scope of this
code, the provisions of this code, as applicaliall dake precedence over the
provisions in the referenced standard.

SECTION 103 FIRE _PREVENTION ENFORCEMENT AGENCY- {

Commented [BM2]: Changes in this section were mad
mostly to match the Fire Code.

103.1_General Creation-of-enforecement-agencyThe Austin Fire Departmert,

under the direction of the Fire Chief, is authaidize implement, administer and
enforce the Wildland-Urban Interface Code. All refeces to code official in thjs
code shall mean the Fire Chief. Appointments, tepuauthority of the code
official, compliance alternatives, appeals, permipdans and specifications,
inspection and enforcement, certificate of completitemporary structures and
uses, fees, service utilities, and stop work ordsrall follow the provisions of the
fire code, as amended, unless additional requiresrsgecific to this code are left|in

Page3 of 15




Ooo~N oo h WN P

place or adopted IocaIIy —'Fhe—department—éN%ER:r—NAME;Ql;

107.1 General. Where not otherwise provided in the requirements thod

International Building-Code-orInternational firade, as amended, or other cog
as amended, permits are required in accordancesedtiion 107.2-through-107.1

107.2 Permits required. Unless otherwise exempted, buildings or struct
regulated by this code shall not be erected, coctsttl, altered, repaired, move

es,
0.

lres
od,

removed, converted, demolished or changed in use@fpancy unless a separate

permit for each building or structure has firstibedtained from the code official.

© ©® N o 0 K~ w N PE
v

. -Metervehicle-fuel dispensing-stations.
10.Open-burning.
11 Pyrotechnical-special-effects.
12 Tents,canopies-and-temporary-membrane-structures.
13.3. Tire storage.

14 4 \Welding-and-cutting-operations.
Paged of 15

Commented [BM3]: Temporary uses and activities,
operations, practices, or functions are all covered initée
code as amended.




O ~Nouoh~WwWNPE

108.1 General.Plans, engineering calculations, diagrams and athta shall b

submitted-in-at-least-two-sets-with-each-applicater—apermit as required by t

flre code, as amended, and as requwed bv thls eﬁ@eenstr—ueﬂen—deeumer

108.3 Site plan.In addition to the requirement for plans in Cityd@dlitle 25, Lanc
Development including the fire code, as amended gdimer codes, as amended;

international-Building-Code, site plans and residential and commercial bl
permit applications, shall include-topegraphywidhd-percent-of grade-of-ace

reads, landscape and vegetation details if requoetemonstrate defensible sp

or a vegetat|on management plan—teeaﬂens—ef—&tras—er—buﬂdum—em;elepe

of |gn|t|on reS|stant constructlon of bundlngsruzitures and the|r appendag@

roof classification of buildings-and-site-waterslypsystems.
108.7 Vicinity plan. In addition to_requirements of the fire code as iaaeel, the

requirements for site plans and residential and neernial building permi
applications, plans shall include details regardimg vicinity within 300 feet (9
440 mm) of lot lines, including other structurdepg, vegetatiorfuel breaks, water|
supply systems and access roads.

SECTION 202
DEFINITIONS

All definitions in Section 202 are adopted unlesgsed [R], new [N] or deleted
[D] as shown here.

[R] FUEL, HEAVY. Vegetation consisting of round wood 3 to 8 inct#&stp 203
mm) in diameter. See fuel models-G—J+-K-anilosed Juniper Woodland
and Mixed Juniper Hardwood Forest described in AdpeD.

Page5 of 15

U

ne
ts




Ooo~N oo h WN P

B e
N = O

o
g s~ w

PR
o~

NNNN -
WNPEF O

NN N
[X &) FN

N
~

WWNN
= O O

w w
w N

[R] FUEL, LIGHT. Vegetation consisting of herbaceous plants anddewod
less than Y4 inch (6.4 mm) in diameter. See fuaetwGH-JK-and-U for Spars
Dry Climate Grass described in Appendix D.

[R] FUEL, MEDIUM. Vegetation consisting of round wood 1/4 to 3 incfted
to 76 mm) in diameter. See fuel models-G+-3ad-Y for Aggrading Juniper
Shrub described in Appendix D.

[R] GREEN BELT. A series of connected open spaces that may follatural

features such as ravines, creeks or streanigel/break-desighated-fora-use-oth
than-a-fire-break.

[R] IGNITION-RESISTANT CONSTRUCTION, -GLASS-1. A schedule o
additional requirements for construction in wildlanrban interface areas based
extreme fire hazard.

conditions affecting the combustibility of both dlihnd and built fuels allow for th
|qn|t|on and spread of fire throuqh the combined! fuomplex—'Fhat—geegmphrc

[N] DISTINCT HAZARD. Threat to life or property from conditions affedi

ignition, spread or intensity of wildfire or as dehined by tables 502.1 and 50p8.

or Appendix C.

302.1 Declaration. The Austin City CounciHegistative-bedy shall daed the
wildland-urban interface areas within the jurisdiction. Thewildland-urban

boundary shall correspond to natural or man maateifes.

302.3 Review of wildland-urban interface areas The code official shal
reevaluate and recommend modification to whkelland-urban interface areas in

Page6 of 15

he

er

re -

e
al

Commented [BM4]: Revised definition to allow inclusio
of ember zone.

- | Commented [BM5]: Findings of fact to support the

location of these areas will be drawn from the 2014 iAust
Travis County Community Wildfire Protection Plan and
inputs used to establish the wildland-urban interfaeasa
for Austin and Travis County; climate, topography, fuel
configurations, both natural and built, and response
capabilities.




'—\
OQwVWoo~N OO, w NP

PR R R R R R
~N~NoOURMAWNER

NN BB
= O O 0

NNDNNDNDN
~NOoO O~ WN

W NN
o ©

www
WN P

w w
(SR8

accordance with section 302.1 on a 3-year basimare frequently as deem
necessary by the Austin City CouneiHegislativelpo

402.1.1 Access.New subdivisions, as determined by City Code Tate Land
Development;-thisjurisdiction shall be providedhifire apparatus access road$
accordance with the fire code, as amendatirnationalFire-Code and -acces

reguirements-in-accoerdance-with Section 403.

402.1.2 Water Supply. New subdivisions, as determined by City Code Titie
Land Development,-thisjurisdiction shall be praddwith fire apparatus acce
roads in accordance with the fire code, as amendestpnational-Fire Code and

access-frequirements-in-aceordance with Section 404.

402.2.1 Access.Individual structures hereafter constructed oocated into o
within wildland-urban interface areas shall be provided with fire apparatus acq
and driveways in accordance with City Code Title P&hd Development, the fi

code, as amendediternationalFire-Code and -driveways—in—accordance—w

Section 403.2. Marking of fire protection equiprngmal-be-provided-in-aceordan
with-Seetion-403.5 and address markers shall baqed in accordance with the fi

code, as amended-Section-403.6.

402.2.2 Water Supply. Individual structures hereafter constructed taated inta

SS

ess
e
ith

re

or withinwildland-urban interface areas shall be provided with a conforming wafer

supply in accordance with City Code Title 25, Ldhelvelopment, the fire code,
amended, and Section 404.

as

403.1 Restricted accessWhere emergency vehicle access is required beed

se

secured access roads or driveways or where imneealtaiess is necessary for |ife
saving or fire-fighting purposes, the code offiggahuthorized to require a key box

to be installed in an accessible location. Theld®y shall be of a type as requi

by the fire code, as amendapproved-by-the-code-official-and-shallcontain ke
to-gaih-necessary-access-as-required-by-the-chdilof

403.2.3 Service limitations. A driveway shall not serve in excess_of 8 5 dingl
units and shall be in accordance with City CodéeT2b, Land Development, a
the fire code, as amended.

Exception: Where such driveways meet the requirements ferdpparatu
access roads in accordance with section 503 offitlee code, as amends

403.3 Fire apparatus access roadfvhere required, fire apparatus access roads
be in accordance with the fire code, as amendesledtherroads-with-a-minimu

Page7 of 15

ined
bYS

[°2)

od

shall




O~NO O~ WNPE

for the purpose of Table 503.1 or as required fw isubdivisions in accordancé

with Section 402.1.2, adequate water supply stalkliétermined by the fire cofle
Sectlon 507 3 and Append|x 8105 1 and B105.2, asnaled—an—appreved—wa er
vice

to protect bUIIdlngS and structures from extermsrr a%ources or to suppress struciure

fires within thewildland-urban interface area of the jurisdiction in accordance with
this section.

501.1 ScopeBuildings and structures located in the wildlamban interface area
shall be constructed in accordance with City Codke 25, Land Development
including the fire code, as amended, other codesnendednternational Building
Code and this code.

Exceptions:

1. Accessory structures not exceeding the allowedrsqoatage per Cit
Code Title 25, Land Development including the ficele, as amende
and other codes, as amended;-120-square-feet)ikifivorarea wher
located not less than 50 feet (15 240 mm) fromdigjs containin
habitable spaces.

T O <

2. Agricultural buildings not less than 50 feet (1®24m) from building
containing habitable spaces.

501.2 Objective.The objective of this chapter is to establish munin standards

locate, design and construct buildings or portitvesof for the protection of life and
property, to resist damage from wildfires, and tbgate building and structure firg¢s
from spreading to wildland fuels. The minimum stards set forth in this chapter

Page8 of 15

Commented [BM6]: Sections 403.4, 403.4.1, 403.5,

403.6, 403.6.1, 403.6.2, and 403.6.3 proposed to be deleted
because marking of roads and fire protection equipmeht gn
address markers are covered in the Fire Code and Land
Development Code.




g ~AWNPEF

vary with proximity to 40 acre or greater contigaawildland fuel areas-the-eritic
fire—weather, slope, and fuel type to provide iasexl protection, above t
requirements set forth in the fire code, as amended other codes, as amend

Hnternational-Buitding-Code, from the various levels of hazard.

Paged of 15

he
ed,




WN -

(635 1

© 00 ~N O

10

12

13
14
15
16
17
18

19
20
21

Table 502.1
Fire Hazard Severity

- tiealEr :
Fuel 1 D 2 to 7 days? ~8 davs
M_ed_e'g SGFE(%) SGFE(%) SGFE(%)
<40 41to-60 >61 <40 41to-60 >61 <40 41to-60 >61
Light M M M M M M M M H
Medium M M H H H H E E E
Heavy H H H H E E E E E
Proximity to Contiguous (40 Acres) Wildland Fuels
Fuel 150’ to 1.5 miles [ <150’
Model® Slope (%)
<10 10 to 25 > 25 <10 10 to 25 >25
Light M M M M M
Medium M M H E E E
Heavy H H H E E E

E = Extreme hazard;
H = High hazard;

M = Moderate hazard
a.Baysperannum

b-Where required by the Fire Chief eede-official, fuel classification shall be based on the historical fuel type for the
area.

503.1 General. Buildings and structures hereafter constructeddified or
relocated into or within theildland-urban interface areas shall meet constructig

requirements in accordance with table 503-1—Cla&ass2-orClass2-3, i Igniti
resistant construction shall be in accordance \@#ttions 504—505—and-5

respectively. Materials required to be ignitiosistant materials shall comply w
the requirements of Section 503.2.

TABLE 503.1
IGNITION-RESISTANT CONSTRUCTION 2

PagelOof 15

n
bn
D6
th




© 00 N O O b~ W

g s -
Water Supply® Water Supphy® Water Supply”
Nef, hla Snacat Cant. bé N 3 be Conf. ; bé N £ be Conf. bé AL 3 ; be
IR 1 IR 1
Nenconforming R2 R R NotPermitted
NC NC
R1—
Conforming R3 R2 R2 R R1
1.5« Conforming Notreguired R-3 R3 1R-2 1R-2 R
Fire Hazard Severity
Moderate Hazard High Hazard Extreme Hazard
Water Supplyb Water Supplyh Water Supplyh
Defensible Space® Cc:mformingd Nonconforming® Confc::rmingd Nonconforming® Confc::rmingd Nonconforming®
Nonconforming R R R R R NP
Conforming NR R R R R R
1.5 x Conforming NR NR NR R R R
R = required

NR = not required
NP = not permitted
a. Access shall be in accordance with Section 403.

b. Subdivision shall have a conforming water supply in accordance with Section 402.1.

1R-1= Ignition-resistant construction in accordance with Section 504.

c. Conformance based on Section 603.
d. Conformance based on Section 404.

e. A nonconforming water supply is any water system or source that does not comply with Section 404, including
situations where there is no water supply for structure protection or fire suppression.

Section 504
Class- Ignition Resistant Construction

sections 504.2 through 504.11.

Pagellof 15

Commented [BM7]: Class 1, 2 and 3 ignition resistant
construction sections from the model code were combimed
1 section. HBA representatives claim all new constructign
already meets class 3 standards. It is not necessarye@ha
separate section for class 2 since the only differemoes f
class 1 were class B roof allowed and less protecfion
eaves. Therefor all new construction in WUI areab wil
require class A roofs. The less protective standard faseav
is added to section 504.3 here.




[EEN
CQOWO~NOUDWNLPE

e e
ORWN PR

B e
o0~ o

N
o ©

NN
N

NN DN
o~ w

N
(o]

NN
0

WWwWwN
WNPF O

w
N

504.3 Protection of eavesEaves and soffits 50 feet (15 240 mm) or closer 40
acre (4.05 ha) or greater contiguous ardagbhf, medium and/orheavy fuel shall be
protected on the exposed underside by ignitiorstasi materials or by materia

approved for not less than 1-hour fire-resistance-ratedstroiction, 2-inch (51 mm)
nominal dimension lumber, or 1-inch (25 mm) nomiira-retardant treated lumbier
or ¥-inch (19.1 mm) nominal fire-retardant-treapdylvood, identified for exterior

use and meeting the requirements of Section 23@3tRe International Building
Code. Fascias are required and shall be protectecherbackside by ignitior

Is

resistant materials or by materialgoroved for not less than 1-hour fire-resistance-

rated construction or 2-inch (51 mm) nominal dimendumber.

Combustible eaves, fascias and soffits more thdeéd@15 240 mm) from a 40 agre

(4.05 ha) or greater contiguous arealight, medium and/orheavy fuel shall be

enclosed with solid materials with a minimum thieks of 3s-inch (19 mm).
Exposed rafter tails shall not be permitted unlessstructed of heavy timbgr

materiali.

504.5 Exterior walls.Exterior walls of buildings or structures 50 fe¥b 240 mm
or closer to a 40 acre (4.05 ha) or greater coatigwarea ofight, medium and/or
heavy fuel shall be constructed with one of the following nuet:

1. Materialsapproved for not less than 1-hour fire-resistance-ratedstroiction
on the exterior side.

2. Approved noncombustible materials.

3. Heavy timber or log wall construction.

4. Fire-retardant-treated wood on the exterior sidde fire-retardant-treated
wood shall be labeled for exterior use and meeteheirements of Sectign

2303.2 of thdnternational Building Code.

5. Ignition-resistant materials on the exterior side.

| _- { Commented [BM8]: From IWUIC IR class 2

Such material shall extend from the top of the ftation to the underside of the rgof

sheathing.

504.7 Appendages and structuredJnenclosed accessory structures attached t¢

buildings with habitable spaces and projectionshas decks and fences (minimpym

10 feet ( 3 048 mm) from attachment point), shalirot less than 1-hour firg- - { commented [BM9]: 5 may be adequate or “at least”

resistance-rated construction, heavy timber coatitnu or constructed of one of the

following:

1. Approved noncombustible materials.
Pagel2 of 15

could be qualified as determined by Fire Chief or if the
adjacent exterior components are ignition resistant.




o~NOoOOUITh W NP

11
12
13

14

15
16
17
18
19
20

21
22
23

24
25
26
27
28
29
30
31
32

33
34

2. Fire-retardant-treated wood identified for exteriese and meeting tf
requirements of Section 2303.2 of tim&ernational Building Code.

3. Ignition-resistant building materials in accordamgth Section 503.2.

504.8 Exterior glazing. Exterior-exterior windows, window walls and glazhzbrs,
windows within exterior doors, and skylights 50tf€E5 240 mm) or closer to a
acre (4.05 ha) or greater contiguous ardagbf, medium and/orheavy fuel shall be
tempered glass, multilayered glazed panels, glesk lor have a fire protectia
rating of not less than 20 minutes.

504.9 Exterior doors.Exterior doors 50 feet (15 240 mm) or closer t40aacre
(4.05 ha) or greater contiguous areaight, medium and/orheavy fuel shall be
approvednoncombustible construction, solid core wood not less than 1 &hég
thick (44 mm), or have a fire protection ratinghot less than 20 minutes. Windo
within doors and glazed doors shall be in accordavith Section 504.8.

Exception: Vehicle access doors.

504.10 Vents. Attic ventilation openings, foundation or undedt vents, or othe
ventilation openings in vertical exterior walls aments through roofs shall n
exceed 144 square inches (0.0929 sach. Such vents shall be covered

noncombustible corrosion-resistant mesh with openings not to edcE8 inch (3.1

e

WS

r
ot

vith
B

mm) Y-ineh{6-4-mm), or shall be designed [aptoved to prevent flame or emb

penetration into the structure. |

Exception: Openings required to be clear by other codes, masnded
provided flame or ember penetration could not reagmbustible materials
surfaces.

504.11 Detached accessory structure®etached accessory structures 50 fee
240 mm) or closer to a 40 acre (4.05 ha) or greaetiguous area dight, medium
and/orheavy fuel and less than 50 feet (15 240 mm) from a buildingtaining
habitable space shall have exterior walls constlatith materialspproved for not
less than 1-hour fire resisitance-rated constractibeavy timber, log wa
construction, or constructed withpproved noncombustible materials or fire
retardant-treated wood on the exterior side. flleeretardant-treated wood sh
be labeled for exterior use and meet the requirésneh Section 2303.2 of th
International Building Code.

603.2.2 TreesTrees are allowed within thdefensible space provided_they are i
accordance with Section 604-4-the-horizontal-destdretween-crowns-of-adjace

Pagel3of 15

(15

all
e

-

2Nt

gli - | Commented [BM10]: This would address dryer vents o

similar exhaust vents where debris accumulation cade
a fire hazard or impede equipment function.




OCoOoO~NOUTA~hW NP

feet(3048-mm).
603.2.3 Groundcover.Fallen deadwoodeadwood-and litter, leaves, needles,

other dead vegetative material shaII be regulmryoved from—tree the ground
the defensible space—A
Ground cover vegetation and other plants not cemsdjtrees—sueh—as—green—gr

y—sueedlents-or-similar-plants-are-used-as-glagverthey are allowed in-to

within the -desighatedefensible space, provided they meet conditions outlined| i
the Fire Criteria Manual to reduce fire mtensrn,darsk of structure ignitior-de-np

prevent fire from enterlng or spreadlnq throuqle tmanomes as deﬁned in lthe Ri
Crlterla Manallll and in accordance Wlth mdustrvldtads for tree care-transmiss|ol

eIectrlc I|ne cIearance shaII complv wrth the Cof\Austm Utilities Crrterra Manudl

Section 1 - Austin Energy Design Criteria.

606.1 General.The storage of liquefied petroleum gas (LPgas)thednstallatior
and maintenance of pertinent equipment shall kec@ordance with the fire cod

e,

as amended+trternatiohal-Fire-Code or, in theradesthereof, recognized standards

and NFPA 58.

606.2 Location of containers or tanks.LP-gas containers or tanks shall be located

within the defensible space in accordance with fine code, as amende
nternational-Fire Code and NFPA 58.

Appendix D (replaced entirely)
FUEL MODELS FREDANGERRATING SYSTEM-

(Section 3.2.1 from the Austin-Travis County Conmity Wildfire Protection Plan available o
line athttp://www.austintexas.gov/wildfireprotectionplan by contacting the City of Austin Fi
Department. Section references and citationssafewand in that plan.)

The most commonly used fire behavior fuel modetsiam that central Texas vegetati
is best described by fuel model variables represiertof a shrub group that includes southe
California chaparral. However, recent researchciagis that while Texas juniper woodlands

Pagel4 of 15

dr

=}

Commented [BM11]: Criteria can be defined to allow
predictability based on structure ignition potent@bximity
to contiguous fuel areas, existence of other structures or
features that would prevent spread of ground fires, and
quantifiable characteristics of landscape vegetdtiets
such as vertical and horizontal continuity, and factioas
would exceed a threshhold of intensity given exposure
during an extreme weather event and fire approachiog ol
a property. The intent is to establish minimum staaheléor
public safety. Best practices for maintaining defeesib
space beyond this code would remain the responsibility
the property owner.

~, | Commented [BM12]: Similar to addressing ground

vegetation, tree criteria can be defined for predictghilith
the objective of breaking continuity and in some cases
reducing canopy density to reduce risk of structure s
to ignition from embers, excessive radiant heat, or
conduction. Tree care industry standards definitfons
canopy raisng and thinning would be applied here.

=



NRRRRRRRRE R R
COONOUIRWNROOONOUIDWNE

NNNDNNN
OO WNEF

WNNN
Qwoo~N

WWWWWWwW
~NOoOOWNE

may look similar to California chaparral commurstiéuel loads and fire behavior are distinctly

different (White et al. 2009, White et al. 201@pecifically, Ashe juniper and certain chapar
species may appear to have similar growth formsvegétative characteristics, but chaparral
species are highly flammable and cold and drougbtérant, which can lead to lots of dead f
In contrast, central Texas vegetation has higherfliel moistures and less dead-fuel loads th
are usually associated with chaparral vegetatiohii@\ét al. 2009, White et al. 2010). Fires
originating in juniper woodlands have slower raiéspread than fires in chaparral vegetatior|
communities because the juniper canopy has a hjgbeortion of live, moist foliage. Also,
juniper woodlands often include hardwoods, sucbaks, that reduce the potential for canopy
fire spread with their relatively sparse arrangenoéfeaves and branches in the canopy.
Due to these attributes, active canopy fires airamature juniper/hardwood forest.
However, when active canopy fire does occur (@eting extreme drought and high
temperatures) in central Texas woodlands, speltificknsed juniper and aggraded juniper
woodlands (see below for further descriptions) fiteeintensity causes stand-replacing fires
which is very similar to how fire behaves in lodglppine in western North America. For the
reasons, and for the purposes of this documenthenohodel described Bection 4.0
regionally specific fuel type data were developeadtiie Balcones Canyonlands Preserve by
White et al. (2009) to more accurately model fiehévior in central Texas.

Sparse, dry-climate grassor grassland, is dominated by generally shodggs that
may be sparse or discontinuous (Scott and Burg@h)2@astures are also considered

grasslands.

Aggrading juniper shrub fuel type is dominated by live oak-juniper and jeri
savanna. It's present throughout the county anddes both Ashe junipedyniperus
ashei), predominantly in western Travis County, and eastedcedarJ(niperus
virginiana), predominately in eastern Travis County. Junguerrch and mortality value

by size class are nearly identical between theseliwiperus species (Engle and Stritzk:

1995).

Closed juniper woodlandhas sufficient canopy closure to limit growth df taass (18
inches or more tall) to less than 50 percent ofjteeind cover. Juniper, including Ashe
juniper and/or eastern redcedar, and deciduous &meethe dominant vegetation types

Mixed juniper hardwood forest fuel type is 25-percent juniper, 75-percent deciguo
class.

Pagel5of 15

el.
an




