OO0y B W~

e e
W —=Oo

—_
5, B =N

[0\ J SN
— O O 00 -1 D

2
o

ORDINANCE NO.

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING ARTICLE 8 OF CITY CODE CHAPTER 25-
12 BY ADDING SECTIONS 25-12-181 INTERNATIONAL WILDLAND-
URBAN INTERFACE CODE, SECTION 25-12-182 CITATIONS TO THE
WILDLAND-URBAN INTERFACE CODE AND  SECTION 25-12-183
LOCAL AMENDMENTS TO THE WILDLAN-URBAN INTERFACE CODE.

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF AUSTIN:

PART 1. Article 8 (Reserved) of City Code Chapter 25-12 (Technical Codes) is
amended to change the title to Wildland-Urban Interface Code and add new sections
25-12-181, 25-12-182 and 25-12-183 to read as follows:

ARTICLE 8. WILDLAND-URBAN INTERFACE CODE Reserved.
§25-12-181 - WILDLAND-URBAN INTERFACE CODE.

(A) The International Wildland-Urban Interface Code and Appendices A
through D, 2015 Edition, published by the International Code Council
(“2015 Wildland-Urban Interface Code”), are adopted and incorporated
by reference into this section with the changes described in Subsection

B) and amendments in Section 25 12183 (Local Amendments to the

2015 Wildland-Urban Interface Code).

(B) - The following sections are amended or deleted

101.4 101.5. -

102.4 10242 }103.1 103.2
1041 - 1042 - 104.3 104.3.1
104.5 1046 104.7 105.1
105.3 me2 & |107.1 107.2
107.4 107.4.1 107.4.2 107.5
107.6.1 107.7 107.8 107.10
108.2 108.3 108.7 108.8
108.10 108.11 108.12 109.1
109.1.2 109.1.2.1 109.1.2.2 109.1.2.3
109.1.4 109..1.4.1 109.1.4.2 109.1.4.3
109.2.1 109.2.2 109.3 109.4
109.4.2 109.4.3 109.4.4 109.4.5

Page 1 of 14

Commented [BM1]: Table revised to correct errors and
for current proposed amendents .




¥1 30 7 958g

_ HAOD FOVITALNI
NVERIN-NVICTIM THL OL SINFIWANANY TVIO'1 - €81-T1-5T §

HWAXXXXXT0C PIO 301m05

(3P0 FoDLIB]U] UDGI]-PUDIPIIA] 947 0 SIBuipuDtly
70007 ) £81-C1-G¢ UoNoas AqQ popusuie S8 Pl ( 8poy soD/IeIH] Ubgi;}-pUDIpILi
[puonpuaiuf) 181-71-6¢ UONI3§F AG PajdOpe Se 9pO7) 30BISNU] UeqI)-PUEIPTIM

1909 #'$09

1109 £ TE09

$0S 11408

1'L+0S L+0S

0S| 1°€0S °1qeL 1°€08

i z'108

01 70¥ T01v0F 1'01'+0b

8'0F L'¥0t 9'¥0p

TEYOY 1€ H0F £0r

£'c0p €T E0Y 1"

T1Tov I'1°20% £70€

il vl TEIT

Tell STl ¥TIl

1711 gIL1 T111

€011 011 1011

L'¥'601 9'¥'601 9°S¥601 $'S¥ 601
1'€S 7601 €560l 1’75601 7S ¥'601

— N onst N



OO Y B U

—_
W —=oOo

—_—
W

—
MO G0 Oy

[N ]
—_ O

(SIS S ST (S I ST G I S S )
[s=JAN < SRR Be N I S VI V]

L W W W
O S

The following provisions are local amendments to the 2015 Wildland-Urban
Interface Code. Each provision in this section is a substitute for the identically

numbered provision deleted by Section 25-12-181(B) (Wildland-Urban Interface
Code) or is an addition to the 2015 Wildland-Urban Interface Code:

101.1 Title. These regulations shall be known as the Wildland-Urban Interface Code
of the City of Austin [NAME-OEJURISBICTION], hiercinafter referred to as “this

code". All references to jurisdiction in this code shall mean the City of Austin.

101.4 Retroactivity. The provisions of the code shall apply to conditions arising
after the adoption thereof, conditions not legally in existence at the adoption of this
code and conditions that, in the opinion ‘of the code official, constitute a distinct
hazard to life or property.

101.5 Additions or alterations. Additions or alterations shall be permitted to be
made to any building or structure without requiring the existing building or structure
to comply with all of the requirements of this:code, provided the addition or
alteration conforme to that required for a new building or structure.

Additions or alterations shall not be made to an existing building or structure that
will cause the existing building or structure to be in violation of any of the provisions
of this code nor shall such additions. or alterations cause the existing building or
structure to become unsafe. An unsafe condition shall be deemed to have been
created if an addition or alteration will cause the existing building or structure to
become structurally unsafe or overloaded; will not provide adequate access in
compliance with the provisions of this code or will obstruct existing exits or access;
will create a fire hazard; will reduce required fire resistance or will otherwise create
conditions dangerous to human life.

102.4 Referenced codes and standards. Thecodesand standards referenced in-this |
codeshall be-these-thatare-listedin Chapter 7 (Referenced Standards) and Chapter |

80 of the Fire Code, as amended, establishes the codes and standards referenced in

the Wildland-Urban Interface Code. and—suchcodes—and standards—shall be

Page 3 of 14

Commented [BM2]: The exception in this section and
section 101.5 was deleted in response to concerns over
applying fire protection requirements of chapter 6, primarily
defensible space, to existing development throughout the
WUI area. AFD will continue to promote Firewise programs
for voluntary provision of defensible space and reserve
authority to recognize distinct hazards to life or property.

/| Commented [BM3]: 102.4 and 102.4.2 were amended to

match the Fire Code. 102.4.1 was not changed as there were
no conflicts identified as in the Fire Code conflicting
mechanical and plumbing codes and standards.

"| Commented [BM4]: This section does not override other

City regulations. These referenced codes and standards are
limited to those listed in these chapters and do not include
the Land Development Code. 102.2 Other laws states “The
provisions of this code shall not be deemed to nullify any
any provisions of local, state or federal law.”




: : : : 2 PapEILIE SE pod
: a.rg aq] u1 pas:mon ne :mr suaumm_; 10 ‘soonderd, suaumado
saumnae poo. sasn KJ?JUdeJ_ [gwa] pa;ualuwo:

R : : BP0 AALT NP s 9 Apsaur
: apnm FIETY uozaoas snn ur sa8uey) [5AE] pailaitwes

|-~

$130 ¢ 28eg

"TRISTIJO SPO? ST} WO PIUTRIGO U22q ISTTE Sl 2110

emmdss B SS9[Un &ouednooo Jo asn m pgﬁup.qo 10 ps

'OFLOTYEROME 7" L(T UONOIS YIIm 99‘12

SOP00 1oJ0 JO 'PIPUSUIE SE ‘OPOD O1f:

Aueoo] padope JO soefa
UT 39T 9T 9p00 ST3 0} ogmsds s;uamsﬂnbax ‘uomppe SSS[UN "PAPUSTUE SB "3pod 211]
343 JO SUOISIA0Id 37} MO[[0] [[BYS SI15pI0 )t.IOM B PuE "SaNIAN 00TAISS S99 "SasU
PUE S3Imongs, ARIOUUE) uouslclumo JO oJeot]I sb IUAMSOI0IUS PUe TOTIO0aCSTI
Suoueogloeas spue  sugpd - Smmaa 7§[eadde “SOANEULIGIE SOUBI[WIOD “[RIDLJO
W‘WW@WW
STU] UT [BIOHJO SP0O70):5a0UaI]al [TV "2DP0;) S9BJIS] UeqI)PUB[PIIA 31 3510JU=
pUE IS)STUIUIDE 1ueut9[dmt 0} pazuoqme ST “JaID) 211, 211 JO UOND3IIp 33 Iapun
uamgeds(] oIty NSy Sy ®’RIRD 1°€01

[AONASV—INHINFSUOINT  NOIINIATNd JuId €01 NOLLOJS|

"PIRPUEIS PASURIAJRI A} UL SUOISIACID
9y} I9A0 2ou9paoaid oxe) [leys ‘ojqesydde se ‘opoo siy Jo suorsiaoxd oy} ‘opoo
s1y) Jo adoos oty UM ST 1B} J19)R 192{qns SOpN[oul PIEPUESS IO SPOd PIOUIIJOI

© 0} S0UDIDJAI U} JO JUSIND SN} DISUAA AL SUJ JO SOUEUIPIO ISUI0UE Aq PolIosds

ST DOUSP202Id SS[Uf] “SPI¥PUE]S PUE SIPOY PIDUIIIJAI UI SHOKIACYJ 7'+ 70T

<t
[an NI o]

@ =N
oo

o O
Lo Mo

= uy \O [~
&N NN

— N
[o Mo M

D= NN T NN D
e g g e et — ot — (]

— N <t W O T~ o2 O



h= I - N« T T - R o R

p— ek
b = O

— = o e e e
o 0o -1 Oy LA R W

B B I
B = O

[FSRRVE BN CE NN O I A S I AN 6 S
— D 0~y L B W

Development mcludmg the fire code, as amended, and other cades, as amended, the
Internationed Building Code, site plans and res1dent1al and commermal bmldmg

permit applications, shall include topesraphy

roads, landscape and vegetation details if reqmred to demonstrate defen51ble space|: - ..i.

or a vegetatton management plan lee&&eﬂs—e{lstmetufes—er—beﬂémg—eﬁve}epes—
! 3 Hdings: types
of 1gmt10n-r631stant constructlon of bu11d1ngs structures and thelr appendages and

roof classification of buildings and-site-water-supply-systems.
Page 5o0f 14




p1 30 ¢ 98eq

SNOILINIZIA
0T NOLLOJS

"SpeoJ $52008 pue swaysss A[ddns
Io1em ‘sypauq janf uoneladea “adojs ‘semyonus ratio Furpnyoui ‘sourf 0] Jo (W Oy
16) 1991 QOE urylim AJUIDIA 1)) Suipsedal s[1eiep apnyoul [reys sue[d “Stoneddde
Jad SUIPMg  [erolownos pue jerjuapisel pue sue[d o)is JOJ Syuawaarmbar
oY) “POPUSIUE SE 2p0% 215 o4} JO sjuoialimbal 0] uomppe u] ugfd AJUIdIA L'80T

1t
0c
6¢

8T
X4
14

§¢
1<
e

T
1T
0c

61
81
Ll

91
|
14!

£l
cl
3

01

i O N PN o -~ oo



O~ O [ TN SN VS I S

10
11
12
13

14
15
16
L7

18
19
20
21

22
23
24
25

26
27
28
29
30
31
32

33
34

[R] WILDLAND-URBAN INTERFACE AREAS. Any developed area where

conditions affecting the combustibility of both wildland and built fuels allow for the

1gmt1on and spread of ﬁre through the combined fuel complex %&Fgeegmph&ea}

[N] DISTINCT HAZARD. Threat to life or property from conditions affecting
ignition, spread or intensity of wildfire or as determined by tables 502.1 and 503.1

or Appendix C.

302.1 Declaration. The Austin City Council Ie—g&slahve%edy shall declare the
wildland-urban interface areas within the jurisdiction.- The wildland-urban

interface areas shall be based on the findings of fact. The wildland-urban interface| .-

boundary shall correspond to natural or man made features.

302.3 Review of wildland-urban interface areas. The code official shall
reevaluate and recommend modification to the wildland-urban interface areas in
accordance with section 302.1 on a 3-year basis or more frequently as deemed

necessary by the Austin City Council legislative-body.

402.1.1 Access. New subdivisions, as determined by City Code Title 25, Land
Development, thisjurisdietion shall be provided with fire apparatus access roads in
accordance with the fire code, as amended. Iuternational Fire-Code and aceess

Fequﬁemeﬂ-trs—m—aeeeféaﬂee—wﬁ-h Sect.wn 403

402.1.2 Water Supply New subchwsmns as determined by City Code Title 25,
Land Development, this—jurisdiction shall be provided with fire apparatus access
roads in accordance with the fire code, as amended, International Fire—Code and

%eemeq&meme&ts—m—&eeerdaﬁee-m%h Section 404,

402.2.1 Access. Individual structures hereafter constructed or relocated into or
within wildland-urban interface areas shall be provided with fire apparatus access

and driveways in accordance with City Code Title 25, Land Development, the fire
code, as amended, futernational FireCode and driveways—in—accordance—with

Section 403.2. Marking of fire protection equipment shall- be provided-in-accordance
with-Seetion403-5 and address markers shall be provided in accordance with the fire

code, as amended Seetion403-6.

402.2.2 Water Supply. Individual structures hereafter constructed or relocated into
or within wildland-urban interface areas shall be provided with a conforming water

Page 7 of 14

i

Commented [BM7]: Revised definition to allow inclusion
of ember zone,

Commented [BMB8]: Findings of fact 1o support the
location of these areas will be drawn from the 2014 Austin-
Travis County Community Wildfire Protection Plan and
inputs used to establish the wildland-urban interface areas
for Austin and Travis County; climate, topography. fuel
configurations, both natural and built, and response

. | capabilities.

Commented [BM9]: Findings of fact have been written to

include 1) Local fire environment, 2) Community values, 3)
Land development in the wildland-urban interface, and 4)
Limited firefighting resources (i.e. in cases of multiple starts
during drought conditions and extreme fire weather)




Fu : il 9P 1u:;md01:maq )
- pirery pa apu;) :mg m;;m pAISAGO A1e g SSppe

: *pue Wotudmba oifoaid ony pue spear Jo Furpem dsanaaq
;' pa:alap oq 0 pasodoid ¢g§0p BUB.TOE0K T £0k- 5500

S¢ EOt' THEr Y €0F SUOU""S [OI-INE] pamamu.tog '

$1 30 g 98eq

‘UOHO2S SHp
MM 20TRPIOSOR U UOTIIPSLING 91 JO pa.p 200L121M1 UDQLH-PUD]PIM SU) UM SOI1)
aronys ssaxddns 03 1o $20I108 s.tg IOLID)XD mog sam;oru;s pue sﬁuzp;mq meJd ol

PSpUSWE SE '5p05; 31 SU) JO 0§ UOHOIS Yt 20UBPIOOOE m SpEO:I $53008
snjeredde any 107 SJUSWLINDAI 31 193U SABMOALID yons aloyp amondadxy

] ‘PapUDTE §8 9p09 SHf I
P JUSWIdOoAS(] PUE] GC. 9111 L 3poD A1i3 TAIA S0UBPIOOJE UI 2q [[BUS PUE SITUN
SUI[[eMp € § JO SS99X3 UI SAISS 10U [[BYS ABMOALIP V' *SUOLEINMI| 3NAIIS €'7°C0F
PO opes-oyAq penbol-se-ssessAiessessu Hes-63
SASLHBIIOo—{{EYS PHE-[BISHIO-9Pes-oAq paoddy POPUSIE S€ @p0J 811 oY) Aq
Ponnbat §e adA] B Jo o [[BUS X0 A9Y 24, ‘UOIBIO[ J[(ISSIDIE UR UI PI[[BISUI 3G OF
x0q A2 e anmbai 01 pazLioyne s [e1o1J0 apoo oy} ‘sesodind Sunysy-o11y Jo Suraes
OJ1 10] ATBSS000U S 853008 JRIPAWW 2ISUM JO SAEMOALIP IO SPEOI SSOI0B POINIOS

~|Jo asneoaq pannbal ST $S9008 IOIYA AOUSTIAWD 2UYA, 'SSIDIB PAILNSIY T'C0P

“POF UCT0Rg DU PIpUSHIE
SE "op0o oXT] oY) JUSWIdO[aAS(] PUB] "S¢ O[ILL 2P0 ANL) ilm souepioose ur AJddns

139
e
£t

[A3
1€
o€
67
8t
LT
9T
5T

¥e
£
(47
ic
0%
61
81
Ll
91
St

¥l
£l
4!

11
01

— o <t ¥ ND I~ 00



i
S WO oIS h o N —

—
N

[ I L e et e d
S ND OO~ N AW

™o
—t

501.1 Scope. Buildings and structures located in the wildland urban interface area
shall be constructed in accordance with City Code Title 25, Land Development

including the fire code, as amended, other codes, as amended, Fternational-Building
&ede and this code.

Exceptions:

1. Accessory structures not exceeding the allowed square footage per City
Code Title 25, Land Development mciudmg the fire code, as amended,
and other codes, as amended, *vin floorarea where
located not less than 50 feet (15 240- ) from buildings containing
habitable spaces.

2. Agricultural buildings not less ]

. 50 feet (15 240 mm) from buildings
containing habitable spaces '

501.2 Objective. The objective of this chapter is to establish minimum standards to
locate, design and construct buildings or pOI‘thﬂS ierof for the protecﬁon of life and
property, to resist damage from wildfires, and to mitigate building and structure fires
from spreading to wildland fuels: ninimum standards set forth in this chapter
vary with proximity to 40 acre or gre ter cont1ggous ‘wildland fuel areas the-critical
Gre—weather, slope,and fuel typeto provide:increased protection, above the
requirements set f¢ fire code, as amended;; ar;,d other codes, as amended,
Het il s levels of hazard.

Page 9 of 14




“2[qe! 93 woy
suonIpuos papmuuad jou urejs: o) sfenfue| ppe pue ajqe; o

90UIRJ2I JAOUIAI O] PISIAI UONAS [ LNG] paiuawiwo) |-~

#1 JO 01 93ed

UOIINIISUO)) JUB)SISIY uonmus| F5581)

SRR

20BdS

9[qISuajep SUTULIOJUOSUOU PUB "A[ddNS I3JBAM SUIULIOJUOIUOU "SS3008 SUTULIOJUOSUOT

AIOASS pIezey oWnXo UJIM Somjonnds JOj pojueis oq Jjou [[eys Snuwiag

"T°€0S uonoag Jo Siﬁawannba.x oy yum

Kjdwoo [[eys s[eLIoIBEW JUBRISIS2I-UONITUS] 2q 01 parnbar S[eLIRIE] AfeAaRoedseroge

PHE-CHSHC SHOHSOS A 9OHEPI0o98 BHoqHEYS UOONYSUOD JUR]SISAI UONTUST ¢
SSBIH0-F-SSBI--S5BFD) “FE05-91483 $()S UOII3S )IM S0UEPIODOE UT SJUauIInbar
UOTIONIISUOD 03U [[BYS $D2.1 201[12)Ul UDGN-PUDIP]ist ) UTGILM IO OJUT pajeoofar

|10 porjipour ‘pejonnsuod I9)jEaISY sarmorms pue sBupjmg '[e.lauaf) 1°€0S

‘Bade

3y} Joj adAy |any |RILIOISIY ALY} UO paseq 3q ||eys uoue:)t;lssep ey raa;;;e—e-paa;alq;} 3113 3y Aq pasinbal alsymeg

HATHERE-SARG P
piezey 21eJBPOIA = [N
‘plezey ydiH = H

‘piezEY BWRIIXI = 3

3 3 3 H H H Aneay

3 3 3 H N W wnipaiy
H W W W W W wan
sz< |szoior| or> sz< [szolor| o1>
' : (%) 3doIS J3PON
J0ST > | S8|IW ST 01 05T [end

S|and puep|ip (sauov 0F) snon3iuo) o3 Awixold

3 3 El 3 El H +H +H H AAESH
3 E} 3 # H H H o] 7t R
H Iad o] w # o] #t ol # 8t
o< | o9eriy o> t9< | ogeriv | or> T9< | 99Oty | o>
tssrodets fesroders {esodeis siepein
shep-g< Shep1o3 T wheat> ot

AJLI9AQS PIBZEE] 11
1°'20s 21981

¥
€
(44

4
0T
61

81
L1
91
Sl
¥l
el

4
I1

01

<t o I~ o0

— NN



VoI bW N~

—
=D

—_—
~N N W

b — —
O O oo

[SE oS
N —

[N T o ]
B W

[ S S
~ O\ Lh

[\
oo

W N
j e )

Lo W W W
E =S VST oS

504.1 General. Class 14 igﬂtion—resistant construction Shall be in accordance with | .-

sections 504.2 through 504.11.

504.3 Protection of eaves. Eaves and soffits 50 feet (15 240 mm) or closer to a 40
acre (4.05 ha) or greater contiguous area of licht, medium and/or heavy fuel shall be
protected on the exposed underside by ignition-resistant materials or by materials
approved for not less than 1-hour fire-resistance-rated construction, 2-inch (51 mm)
nominal dimension lumber, or 1-inch (25 mm) nominal fire-retardant treated lumber
or %-inch (19.1 mm) nominal fire-retardant-treated plywood, identified for exterior
use and meeting the requirements of Section 2303.2 of the International Building
Code. Fascias are required and shall be protected on the backside by ignition-
resistant materials or by materials approved for not less than 1-hour fire-resistance-
rated construction or 2-inch (51 mm) nominal dimension lumber.

Combustible eaves, fascias and soffits more. than 50 feet (15 240 mm) from a 40 acre

(4.05 ha) or greater contiguous area of light, medium and/or heavy fuel shall be
enclosed with solid materials with a minimum thickness of %-inch (19 mm).
Exposed rafter tails shall not be permitted unless constructed of heavy timber
materials.

504.5 Exterior walls. Exterior walls of b.uildings or structures 50 feet (15 240 mm)
or closer to a 40 acre (4.05 ha) or greater contiguous area of light, medium and/or
heavy fuel shall be oo'r_lstructe_d with one of the following methods:

L ARG s oved for not less than I-hour fire-resistance-rated construction
on the exterior side. = . = .

2. Approved nbncom_bus'tfbl’e materials.
3. Heavy timber or log wall construction.

4. Fire-retardant-treated wood on the exterior side. The fire-retardant-treated
wood shall be labeled for exterior use and meet the requirements of Section
2303.2 of the International Building Code.

5. Ignition-resistant materials on the exterior side.

Such material shall extend from the top of the foundation to the underside of the roof
sheathing.

504.7 Appendages and structures. Unenclosed accessory structures attached to
buildings with habitable spaces and projections, such as decks and fences, shall be
not less than [-hour fire-resistance-rated construction, heavy timber construction or
constructed of one of the following:

Page 11 of 14

Commented [BM12]: Class 1, 2 and 3 ignition resistant
construction sections from the model code were combined in
1 section. HBA representatives claim all new construction
already meets class 3 standards. It is not necessary to have a
separate section for class 2 since the only differences from
class 1 were class B roof allowed and less protection of
eaves. Therefor all new construction in WUI areas will
tequire class A roofs. The less protective standard for eaves
is added to section 504.3 here.

| { commented [BM13]: From IWUIC IR class 2

__.--"| Commented [BM14]: Revised due to ambiguity over
dimensions. Rules could specify options for fencing to
reduce risk of structure ignition and impact to trees
overhanging combustible fences.




: . orrung wsurdmba spadun 3o prezeq Ay &
asnm pmo:; HOLEJMIIIN STHISD AR M SIUSA JETE X Teruns

1o a2k, Jakip ssarppe PMOASTL : [5 Linig] patusiuuiod,

| smopuig "SoInUIY (7 UBL) s {ibu Jo

¥1 3o Z1 98eg

"2posy Sutppng [PHORDIULBIU]
o1 Jo 7'€0€Z Uonoag Jo sjuswannbal oY) 109w puR 95N IOUINS O] PAISGER] 99

| 1eys poom paresn-juepiEleI-a1y YL SPIS JOLISIXD QU) UO POOM PRIBII-IURPIEISI

-] 1O S[BLIDIEW 27GNSHQUIOOUOU PaA0LddD UM PIONISUOD 10 “UONONNSUOD
fem Bo] ‘oquiy AAR9Y ‘UOLONNSUOD PIJBI-2OUBIISISAI U JINOY-] URY) SS9
10U 10} paao4dd S[erIa3ew YiIm PIONISU0D Sj[em JOLIIXD 9wy [[eys 20eds S[qe)Iqey

%’ururemoo Bmp;mq e woy (U 0z S1) 109) ()g UBY) SSOY: puR 757 AADSY J0/pUE
135070 1O (U (03¢

IIM pa.IaAoa 3q peys spuai
10U [[BYS $JOOI YInoayl:

$Y00P §59008 o[oWa A uondaoxy

10098 Ul 34 [] S S100p paéelﬁ PUE SI0OP Ui
1 101192705 211 B 2ABY JO ‘(U ) HORy

SOYOUT % | UEY) SSI]-JOU POOM 2100 PI[OS:UONONIISUOD 2jqiisnquioduott paroldde
oq [|eys J37 AADaY 10jpUe WIRpsul T5]] JO €SIE SHONSNU0D Iojeals 10 (B S0'1)

3108 (F € 0) 1oS0[3 10 (W 0¢ G1) 193] DT SI00P IOLIIXF *SI00p I0LI)XT 6'H0S

"SRINUIUT ()7, URL $$2] 10U Jo Suner
uonoajod 213 B 2aRY 10 J20) sselﬁ ‘sjoued pazZe[d palafe[ninui ‘sse[d pasodwg)
2q [[BYS T Away T0/pUE Wlpowl TiST] JO BOIE SAONBTUOJ 19jB3I8 10 (B G 1) 2008
0 & 0] 18502 10 (WO (7 G1)3123Y S SIYSIANS PuB ‘SI00P JOLIIXD UMM SMOPULM
‘SIO0P POZE[S PUR S[[EM MOPULM ‘SMODULM 36H07%6 TOLRIXY "SUIZR[S I0LIIXT ]'p0S

‘g’ ﬂ)g ToIj0ag I,

“Z'€0S UONSOS YIIM S0URPIOIVR LI S[ELIfBW SUIP[INg JUeISISO-UONIUS] ¢

‘apoy) Suippng [puonpuaIul 9 JO 7 E0ET UON0es Jo sjuawannbal
ay} Sunealtl pue SN IOLDIX? 0] PIANUIPL POOM PRIBSL-UBPIRIAI-AIL] T

‘S[RLISIBUL 2)qUSHqIosuoy paacsddy |

2

£e
[43
It
0t
6¢
8¢
LT
9%
ST

¥
€T
(44

14
0t
61
81
Ll
91

s1

¥l
£l
4!
11
01

™~ <f Vi o~ co Y

—



O co o B R T W b —

aﬂd—ems{rmg buildings, structures and premises located within wildland-urban
interface areas.

603.2.2 Trees. Trees are allowed within the defensible space provided they are in

accordance with Section 604 4 t—he—hefmeﬂ%al—ésmﬂee—bemﬁ—efewns—eﬁadﬁeeﬂt

vegetanon understory plants and shrubs Ieaf 11tter and mulch are allowed to be

within the designated defensible space, provided they do not form a means of
transmitting fire &em—&em—na%e—gemh 1o tree canopies or &y structures.

6044Tree§, e e

prevent ﬁre from entermg or sm'eadma throug.h canopies in accordance Wlth City of
Austin regulations. transms e
suppression operations. Overhead clcctmc hnc clearance shall comply w1th the City
of Austin Utilities Criteria Manual Section 1 - Austin Energy Design Criteria.

606.1 General. The storage of liquefied petroleum gas (LPgas) and the installation
and maintenance of pertinent equipment shall be in accordance with the fire code,
as amended, International Fire Code or, in the absence thereof, recognized standards
and NFPA 58.

606.2 Location of containeré or taﬂks. LP-gas containers or tanks shall be located
within the defensible space in accordance with the fire code, as amended,
International-Eire-Code and NFPA 58.

Appendix D (replaced entirely)
FUEL MODELS HREDANGERRATINGSYSTEM

(Section 3.2.1 from the Austin-Travis County Community Wildfire Protection Plan available on-
line at http://www.austintexas.gov/wildfireprotectionplan or by contacting the City of Austin Fire
Department. Section references and citations are as found in that plan.)

Page 13 of 14

Commented [BM16]: Revised to correspond with sections
101.4 and 101.5 removing exceptions for retroactivity to
parts of the code specifically applying to requirements for
existing,

| Commented [BM17]: Revised to only address risk of fire

spread to tree canopies or structures. Criteria can address
specifics starting with ignition resistance of the structure.

| Commented [BM18]: Environmental Commission

conditions to add language here to require a qualified
arborist and follow standards of care as required for public
trees may exceed City authority to enforce. As with
application of defensible space it would be promoted through
outreach and education programs or required in situations
that allow for special conditions in exchange for other
development rights. 6-3-42 requires removal of diseased tree.
Reference to City of Austin regulations means Chepter 6-3
as well as title 25




#1 Jo p1 a8eq

"SSEPD

STIOTIPIOap JUa01ed-¢/, " 1odIunl JUa0Iad-Cg 51 0dA3 [o0] J5910] POGA DB JaGn] paxiy

“$SUAY UOTIEISE5A JUBUIOP SUj o1C 50313 SNONPIOSp PUE 1epadpal WI15Es, 10,pue 1adian|
DI0U 10 $5T50

153107 poomplmy.laamm a.mmu.l T SIETBIE Sa11] Ad0UED 9ARIE SIUqUIE 9501 0 oii¢]
"ATOUE 1)) UI SAOUTIq PUE SOAES] 10 JUSTHSTHELIE o51eUs A[ATe[a] L) A Pesids 31
AT0MEs 107 [enuajod oUF oonpal B0 §E T[5iiS SpoompIey apn[oul UahO SPUB|POOA J5aium]
GE[Y IBN[0] JSTOUT "IAT] JO.UOHI0A0Id T3S ¢ SEY] AJOUEs 301Nl 6U) $1E53q SaNURIIIes
TOTIEIa9aA [EaIedeyD Ul Sallj LBy} PEads JO Sa7el J9MO[S SARY SPUPIPOCA I3UMGNT UT SUNEUTSTI0
TeL SPEO] [o7-PEap 599 PUE SOITGSIOW [AT]-0Al] JoUSTY SBY U0TBjA55A SERS] [E1Ua0 TSEu0D U]
“[oTy PEAP JO 530] 03 PES] UED UoAA JUEI[OUT JUBN0IP PUE Plod P S[qEIIIE]] A[Uo1Y 916 S210a08
[ELECED ING S31ELII0RIED OATIEI209A PUE SULI0) (NMO1S TE[TITS 948 0] 1EaUde ABW 5210308
TELEdE) UIeT150 puE Jo0Iun SUSy AJfeonIoads {0107 18 18 SIA 600Z T2 18 I AL) I
ATIOULSIP 278 JOTABUA] 911] PUE SPEO| [811) “So0TUnUII0D [eXIedeyo CIEOJI[e. ) 0] JB[[LIIS JOO0] AB
SPUB[POOA Jadiunl SEX3 [ a[1UA THI{] $eaIpul UoItasal Juadal JenoMO [ELEdeyd SILIoJE,)
WIDINOS Saph[oul JULjj driG1s IS € JO sAneIuasaIUal So]qeLIEA [SpOLE [0 Aq paqUDsap 1534 ot
UONERESA SEXS] TeIUa0 Jei) SWINSSE S[apOLl [Ty I0IABUSq J11] pasn AJUOII0) SO 34 |

— N T WO 00 Gy



