00 ~I N L B U R e

—
LI N = OO

F— e
[ BN

[N I N I e R
— O D 00~ O

N
[\

ORDINANCE NO.

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING ARTICLE 8 OF CITY CODE CHAPTER 25-
12 BY ADDING SECTIONS 25-12-181 INTERNATIONAL WILDLAND-

URBAN INTERFACE CODE, SECTION 25-12-182 CITATIONS TO THE!}

WILDLAND-URBAN INTERFACE CODE AND SECTION 25-12-183

LOCAL AMENDMENTS TO THE WILDLAN-URBAN INTERFACE CODE. |

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF AUSTIN:

PART 1. Article 8 {Reserved) of City Code Chaptel 25-12 (Technical Codes) is
amended to change the title to Wildland-Urban Interface Code and add new sections
25-12-181, 25-12-182 and 25-12-183 to read as follows: - -

ARTICLE 8. WILDLAND-URBAN IN'IERFACE CODE Resewed
§25-12-181 - WILDLAND- URBAN INTERFACE CODE.

(A)  The Internatxonal Wﬂdland~Urban Interface Code and Appendwes A
through D, 2015 Edltzon, pubh hed by the International Code Council
(2015 Wildland-Urban Interface Code”), are adopted and incorporated
by reference into this sectlon w1th the changes desctibed in Subsection
(B) and amendments in Section 25-12- 183 (Local Amendments to the
2015 Wzldland Urban Interface Code).

= Therfollowm : sectxons are amended or deleted

1014|1015

1024 |10242 _ |1031 103.2
1041|1042 [1043 104.3.1
104.5 1046 1047 105.1
105.3 11062 - - 1071 107.2
107.4 10741 110742 107.5
107.6.1 107.7 107.8 107.10
108.2 108.3 1087 108.8
108.10 108.11 108.12 109.1
109.1.2 109.1.2.1 109.1.2.2 109.1.2.3
109.1.4 109..1.4.1 109.1.4.2 109.1.4.3
109.2.1 109.2.2 109.3 109.4
109.4.2 109.4.3 109.4.4 109.4.5

Page1o0f 14 -

i1 for current proposed amcndcnis

- ,‘ Commented [BM‘I] Tnblc rcvxsedto comect enots and
L



Lo~ N BN e

—t ek o ek
W R = O

[ Y
(W NN

— e el
O 00 ~) O

AV
—

NN NN
~ AN B W

28
29
30

31
32
33
34

The following provisions_are local amendments to the 2015 Wildland-Urban
Interface Code, Each provision in this section is a substitute for the identically
numbered provision deéleted by Section 25-12-181(B) (Wildland-Urban Interface
Code) or is an addition to the 2015 Wildland-Urban Interface Code:

101.1 Title. These regulations shall be known as the Wildland-Urban Interface Code
of the City of Austin {NAME-OFJURISDICTION], hereinafter referred to as “this

code". All references to jurisdiction in this code shall mean the City of Austin.

101.4 Retroactivity. The provisions of the code shall- -apply to conditions arising
after the adoption thereof, conditions not 1egally in existence at the adoption of this
code and conditions that, in the opinion of the code official, constitute a distinct
hazard to life or property.

to comply with all of the' requuements of thi ""!icpde',' provided the addition or

alteration conforms to that reqmred for a new bulldmg ‘or structure.

Additions or alterations, shall not be made to an existing building or structure that
will catise:the eXIStmgbmldmg or structure to be in violation of any of the provisions
of this code nor shall such additions or alterations cause the existing building or
structure to become unsafe. An unsafe condition shall be deemed to have been
created if an addition or alteration will cause the existing building or structure to
become structurally ‘unsafe or overloaded; will not provide adequate access in
compliance with the provisions of this code or will obstruct existing exits or access;
will create a fire hazard; will reduce required fire resistance or will otherwise create
conditions dangerous to human life.

102.4 Referenced codes and standards. Thecodes-and standards referenced-inthis
code-shall be-thosethat are listed-in Chapter 7 (Referenced Standards) and Chapter
80 of the Fire Code, as amended, establishes the codes and standards referenced in
the Wildland-Urban Interface Code. and—such—codes—and—standards—shall-be

Page 3 of 14

|
A Commented IBMA): This section does notmemde other E
31
l
i

1

(S R R i

erommented [BMZ] Th¢ exceptmn in tlus sef:lmn and
+ section 101 5 was deleted in response to concerns pver
: applying fire protection requirements of cliapter 6, primarily
def‘emﬁﬂc space, to existing development throug,hsut the

| WUlarea AED will continuc to. promote Firewise programs |
far voluntary pmvxsmn Qf defensible space and Teserve

i Commented [BM3]: 102.4 and 102 4.2 were amended to }

i match the Fire Code. 102.4.1 was not changed as there v were
ino conflicts identified as in the Fire Code conflicting
mcdmm&al and phumbing codes and standards.

City requlations. These referenced codes and standards are |
; limited to those listed in these chaptersand donot include
the Land Development Code. 102.2 Other laws states “The |
provisions of this code shall not be deemed to nullify any

‘Larg_pxtc;visidns of local, state or _f_cdgxaﬂm"




N R R N - R ¥, B e

— e
o = O

bttt ek ok ot
O oo~y h bW

I
[S o ]

23
24
25
26
27
28
29
30
31

R A o B

10.Open-burning:

11 Pyrotechnical special-effeets: ,
13.3-Tire sterage: '

14.4-

108.1 General. Plans engmeermg calculatlons dlagrams and other data shall be
submitted i , : as required by the
fire code as amended and as reqmred by_’[hls code. %e»eeﬂstfaeﬂeﬂ—éeeumeﬂ%s

108.3 Site plan. In addmon 10 the requirement for plans in City Code Title 25, Tand
Development including the fire code, as amended, and other codes, as amended, the
International Building Code, site plans and residential and commercial building
permit applications, shall include tepegraphy—width-and percent-of prade-of aceess

feaés— landscape and vegetation detalls 1f required to demonstrate defen51ble space

of 1gn1t10n-r651stant constmctlon of buildings, structures and their appendages and

roof classification of buildings and-site-water-supply-systems.
Page 50f 14




[oTa RN B N R NS R S

10
11
12
13

14
15
16
17

18
19
20

.21

22
23
24
25

26
27
28
29
30
31
32

33
34

[R] WILDLAND URBAN INTERFACE AREAS. Any developed area where |

conditions affecting the combustibility of both wildland and built fuels allow for the

1gmt10n dnd splead of fire through the combmed fuel complex Ihd{—geegfaph}e-al

[N] DISTINCT HAZARD. Threat to life or property from conditions affecting
12n1t10n spread or intensity of wildfire or as determined by tables 502.1 and 503.1
Appendix C. :

302.1 Declaration. The Austin City Counm legislahve—bedy shall declare the

wildland-urban interface areas within the jurisdiction. . The wildland-urban

interface areas shall be based on the ﬁndmgs of fact. The wz/dlana’—uz ban interfuce |

boundary shall correspond to natural or man made features.

302.3 Review of wildland-urban interface areas. The code official shall
reevaluate and recommend modification to the wildland-urban interface areas in
accordance with section 302.1 on a 3-year basis or more frequently as deemed
necessary by the Austm City Councﬂ legtsla-twe—bedy

402.1.1 Access. New subdmsmns as determmed by Cltv Code Txtle 25, Land
Development, ﬁa&ﬂﬁﬂsé}eﬁeﬁ shall be prowded with fire apparatus access roads in
accordance w1th the ﬁ:e code as amended, Frternational-Fire-Code and aceess
;< Sectlon 403

402.1. 2 Water Supply New subd1v1smns as determined by City Code Title 25,
Land Development, ' shall be provided with fire apparatus access
roads in accordance thh the fire code as amended, beternationalFire-Code and
ith Section 404.

'V'ihglividuél;Snuctures hereafter constructed or relocated into or

402.2.1 Access. Individual
within wildland-urban interface areas shall be provided with fire apparatus access
and driveways in accordance with City Code Title 25, Land Development, the fire

code, as amended, InternationalHire—Code and driveways—in—accordance—with

Section 403.2. Marking of fire protection equipment shall-be providedin-accordance
with-Seetion-403.5 and address markers shall be provided in accordance with the fire

code, as amended Seetion403-6.

402.2.2 Water Supply. Individual structures hereafier constructed or relocated into
or within wildland-urban interface areas shall be provided with a conforming water

Page 7 of 14

e i e L

(Eommented [BMS] Revxsed deﬁmtmn m alinw mclusmn i
iofmnberzonc \ .

e

| Commented [BNHO] Fmdmgsz of fact Irase l)een wiitlen ,
to include 1) 1ocal fire environment, 23 Community values,
3) Land developmient in the wildland-urban interface, and 4)
Limited firefighting resources (i.e. in cases of multiple starts |
{ dunn& drought mndmnns and extreme fire w:ather) |




WO -1 W BN e

501.1 Scope. Buildings and structures located in the wildland urban interface area
shall be constructed in accordance with City Code Title 25. Land Deévelopment
including the fire code, as amended. other codes, as amended, fmternational Building
Code and this code.

Exceptions:

1. Accessory structures not exceeding the allowed square footage per City
Code Title 25, Land Development including the fire code, as amended
and other codes, as amended, 120-square feet (11m?) infloorarea where
located not less than 50 feet (15 240 mm) from buildings confaining
habitable spaces. o ’

2. Agricultural buildings not less than 50 feetk(ls 240 mm) from buildings
containing habitable spaces.

501.2 Objective. The objective of this chapter is to establish minimum standards to
locate, design and construct buildings or portions therof for the protection of life and
property, to resist damage fromy wildfires, and to mitigate building and structure fires
from spreading to wildland fuels: The minimum standards set forth in this chapter
vary with proximity to 40 acre or greater contiguous wildland fuel areas the-eritieal
fire—weather, slope, and fuel type to provide increased protection, above the
requirements set forth in the fire code, as amended. and other codes, as amended,
bﬁﬁﬁﬁff@ﬁﬁ#ﬁm@ﬁg@@ﬁle, from the various levels of hazard.

Page 9 of 14




Nel-LIEN e NIV RN U S

504.1 General. Class-1 [gnition-resistant construction shall be in accordance with
sections 504.2 through 504.11.

504.3 Protection of eaves. Eaves and soffits 50 feet (15240 mm) or closer to a 40
acre (4.05 ha) or greater contiguous area of light, medium and/or heavy fuel shall be
protected on the exposed underside by ignition-resistant materials or by materials
approved for not less than 1-hour fire-resistance-rated construction, 2-inch (51 mm)
nominal dimension lumber, or 1-inch (25 mm) nominal fire-retardant treated lumber
or %-inch (19.1 mm) nominal fire-retardant-treated plywood, identified for exterior
use and meeting the requirements of Section 2303.2 of the International Building
Code. Fascias are required and shall be protected on the backside by ignition-
resistant materials or by materials approved for not less than 1-hour fire-resistance-
rated construction or 2-inch (51 mm) nomin'al dimension [umber.

Com ustxble eaves, fascias and sofﬁts morcrthdn 50 fcet 1 ‘5724071nm Vfrom a740 acre

enclosed with solid materials with a2 minimum th1ckness of 3/é—mch 19 mm).
Exposed rafter tails shall not be permmed unless constructed of heavy timber

materials.

504.5 Exterior walls, Exterior Walls of bu11d1ngs or structures 50 feet (15 240 mm)
or closer to a 40 acre (4. 05 ha) or greater contigudus area of light, medium and/or
heavy fuel shall be constructed with one of the following methods:

1. Materials approved for not less than 1- hour fire-resistance-rated construction
on. the exterior side.

2. Approved noncombustlble materlals
3. Heavy tunber or log wall constructlon

4. Fire- retardant~treated Wood on the exterior side. The fire-retardant-treated
wood shall be labeled for exterior use and meet the requirements of Section
2303.2 of the International Building Code.

5. Ignition-resistant materials on the exterior side.

Such material shall extend from the top of the foundation to the underside of the roof
sheathing.

504.7 Appendages and structures. Unenclosed accessory structures attached to or
m) of buildings with habitable spaces and projections, such
as decks shall be not less than 1-hour fire-resistance-rated construction, heavy timber
construction or constructed of one of the following:

Page 11 of 14

i Commented [BM‘!B] Class | 2and3 fonition resistant |
construction sections from the model code were combil

1 section. HBA mprecentatives claim all new

83

+ already meet: class 1 standarde. I |
separate section for class T since ﬂlh only differences from :
class | were class B roof allowed and less protection of 3
!

i

caves. Thereforall new construction in WUl areas will
! rcqmre class Aroofs. The less protective standard for caves |
4 |

B T oo

e A S e L e S S e

. irM(:::»mmen‘i:ed [BM14] From IWUICIR class ’7 |

, Commented [BM15]

B




Lo And L o=

be labeled for exterior use and meet the requirements of Section 2303.2 of the
International Building Code.

601 1 Scope. The provisions of this chapter establish general requirements for new

aﬁé——eeastmg buildings, structures and premises located within" wildland-urban
interface areas.

603.2.2 Trees. Trees are allowed within the defensiblé spdce provided they arein
accordance w1th Sccnon 604.4 the—heﬁiem&l—d*s%aﬂee%e{weeﬂ—efe%sef—adjaeeﬂ%

Austin g cgulahons mﬁmwem

suppfesaeﬁ—epcfa&eﬂs Overhead electric 11ne clearance shall complv with the City
of Austin Utllltles Cntena Manual Sectlon 1 - Austin Energy Design Criteria.

606.1 General The storage of hqueﬁcd petroleum gas (LPgas) and the installation
and maintenance of “pertinent equipment shall be in accordance with the fire code,
as amended, International Hire Code or, in the absence thereof, recognized standards
and NFPA 58,

606.2 Location of containers or tanks. L.P-gas containers or tanks shall be jocated

within the defensible space in’ accordance with the fire code, as amended,
InterneationaiFire-Code and NFPA 58.

Appendix D (replaced entirely)

FUEL MODELS FHREDANGER-RAFING-SYSTEM
Page 13 of 14

nsk qf fire |

Commented [BMIS} Rewaed t(; ol
pxmd 10 Irec canopies or st .
cs startmg : with 1 1 igt

e R S

ommented [BMZO] En» mmmemal C‘cpmmlssmn ¢
onditions to add language here to require a qualified |
arbomt and follow standards of care as required for public :

i

trecs may exceed City authority to enforce. As with =
apphcatwn of defensible space it would be promoted through |
ouxmasch and education programs ot rece) red in situations
that allow for special conditions in exchange forother
* development rights. 6347 requires removal of diseased tree, f
i Reference to Ciy of Austin rcgsulatmns means Lhapter 6-3 {
- E

! as well as title




