From: First NameMYEC GeneralManager [mailto:myecgm@yahoo.com]
Sent: Wednesday, December 9, 2020 2:38 PM

To: Thuy Duong

Cc: David Hansen

Subject: Fw: TCIMA Approves MYEC EMERGENCY HVAC REPAIR

Memo to MYEC Operations File:

Travis County called me Tuesday morning around 7am to advise the Election workers complaint
the HVAC was around 30 degrees in the facility.

I contacted Davis Hansen, MYEC Operations Manager to advise of the problem. David reported
back two units in the East End Arena, East and West Unit gas igniters were not firing so the heat
was not coming on as set. Entech the HVAC service company for the COA was contacted for an
Emergency Repair to the units. They identified the problem, made a diagnosis and

determined equipment to order. ASM was notified of the emergency repair to approve
expenditure. Today, VSilas, GM received approval from Tony to proceed with the repair. The
estimated expense was $2249.50 however a final expense will be forthcoming when the work is
completed. Entech is currently in the MYEC working on the repair.

FYT and file. Please acknowledge receipt.

V. Silas,

Operations Director & General Manager

"The Millennium Youth Entertainment Complex"”
1156 Hargrave Street

"On the East Side"

Austin, Texas 78702

512 472-6932

512 964-2713 ¢

www.myec.net

"The Millennium, Keeping the Promise!"
est. June 18, 1999 www.myec.net

----- Forwarded Message -----
From: Tony Cima <tcima@asmglobal.com>


http://www.myec.net/

To: Vanessa McQueen-Silas (Austin TX) <myecgm@yahoo.com>; David Hansen (Austin Texas)
<myecopmanager@myec.net>

Sent: Wednesday, December 9, 2020, 06:07:21 AM MST

Subject: RE: MYEC EMERGENCY HVAC REPAIR

If you need my Approval...then Approved!

Tony

Tony Cima
Senior Vice President

Stadiums & Arenas

ASM GLOBAL
+1610.729.7869 Office
+1215.284.7684 Mobile

tcima@asmglobal.com

asmglobal.com
300 Conshohocken State Road, Ste 770

West Conshohocken, PA 19428, USA

From: First NameMYEC GeneralManager <myecgm@yahoo.com>
Sent: Tuesday, December 8, 2020 1:57 PM

To: David Hansen (Austin Texas) <myecopmanager@myec.net>
Cc: Tony Cima <tcima@asmglobal.com>

Subject: Re: MYEC EMERGENCY HVAC REPAIR

CAUTION:EXTERNAL EMAIL - use caution opening links or attachments.


mailto:tcima@asmglobal.com

Can you please have the HVAC company place EMERGENCY on their invoice. Also, what is
the cost estimate?

Prepare a PO. I am copying this to Corporate ASM as they have to "approve all expenses not
listed as essential on our budget".

Thank you.

V. Silas,
Operations Director & General Manager

"The Millennium Youth Entertainment Complex"
1156 Hargrave Street

"On the East Side"

Austin, Texas 78702

512 472-6932
512 964-2713 ¢

www.myec.net

"The Millennium, Keeping the Promise!”

est. June 18, 1999 www.myec.net



http://www.myec.net/
http://www.myec.net/

On Tuesday, December 8, 2020, 10:05:46 AM MST, David Hansen <myecopmanager@myec.net> wrote:

Mrs. Silas;

The HVAC systems for the skate zone are reading as they are firing and running.
In a roof top inspection this morning at 7 am showed that both units are down.

| contacted Entech and they responded quickly.

Both units have bad igniter motors.

Replacement parts will be in tommarow.

The tec was able to rig the units to run until tommarow.

Then they will replace the failing components.

P.S.

The inside temp this morning on the system was 52 degrees not 32.

David

Notice: This email may contain confidential and/or proprietary information and is intended only for the use
of the Individual(s) or entity(ies) named above. Any unauthorized use, dissemination, or copying of this
email is strictly prohibited if you are not the intended recipient of this email. If you have received this email
in error, notify the sender by replying to this message and delete the email from your system. When
responding to this communication, remember that it could be lost in transit and viewed by a party other
than the addressee.
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